IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE SEVENTEENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT, IN AND FOR BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA

CASE NO. 12-028324 COMPLEX LITIGATION UNIT

P&S ASSOCIATES, GENERAL PARTNERSHIP, a Florida limited partnership; and S&P ASSOCIATES, GENERAL PARTNERSHIP, a Florida limited partnership,

Plaintiffs,	
V.	
ROBERT P. ALVES, et al.,	
Defendants.	

NOTICE OF FILING AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF DEFENDANTS STEVEN JACOB AND GUARDIAN ANGEL TRUST, LLC'S MOTION FOR ATTORNEY'S FEES

Defendants STEVEN JACOBS and GUARDIAN ANGEL TRUST, LLC, file the attached Affidavit of Peter G. Herman in support of their Motion for Attorney Fees filed on August 15, 2014.

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I HEREBY CERTIFY that a true copy of the foregoing was furnished to all interested parties via E-filing this 22nd day of August, 2014.

TRIPP SCOTT, P.A.
Attorneys for Defendants STEVEN JACOB and GUARDIAN ANGEL TRUST, LLC
110 S.E. 6th Street, 15th Floor
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301
Telephone: (954) 525-7500

Facsimile: (954) 761-8475

By: s/Peter G. Herman

Peter G. Herman Fla. Bar No. 353991 Primary: pgh@trippscott.com, asg@trippscott.com Secondary: ele@trippscott.com

rep@trippscott.com

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE SEVENTEENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT, IN AND FOR BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA

CASE NO. 12-028324 COMPLEX LITIGATION UNIT

P&S ASSOCIATES, GENERAL PARTNERSHIP, a Florida limited partnership; and S&P ASSOCIATES, GENERAL PARTNERSHIP, a Florida limited partnership,

Plaintiffs,
v.

ROBERT P. ALVES, et al.,

Defendants.

AFFIDAVIT OF PETER G. HERMAN IN SUPPORT OF DEFENDANTS STEVEN JACOB AND GUARDIAN ANGEL TRUST, LLC'S MOTION FOR ATTORNEY'S FEES

STATE OF FLORIDA COUNTY OF BROWARD

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, personally appeared PETER G. HERMAN who, after being by me sworn on oath, deposes and states:

- 1. I am over 18 years of age and I make this affidavit based on personal knowledge of the facts herein.
 - 2. I am counsel for Steven Jacobs and Guardian Angel Trust, LLC in this case.
- 3. The attached attorney time was billed by me for my services in this case, 26 hours x \$450 per hour, for a total amount of \$11,700.00.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

PETER G. HERMAN

SWORN TO and subscribed before me this 22nd day of August, 2014.

MY COMMISSION 10, 2015
EXPIRES: January 10, 2015
Notary Public Underwriters
Notary Public

NOTARY STAMP:

EXHIBIT "A" TO AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF DEFENDANTS STEVEN JACOB AND GUARDIAN ANGEL TRUST, LLC'S MOTION FOR ATTORNEY'S FEES

Timesheet of work performed by Attorney Peter G. Herman *As Counsel for Defendants Steven Jacob and Guardian Angel Trust, LLC* Tripp Scott, P.A. 110 SE 6 St., 15th Fl Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301 954 525 7500

DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION OF WORK
11/19/13	1.5	Preparation for and attendance at meeting with client.
11/18/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
11/18/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
11/20/13	4.0	Preparation for and attendance at hearing.
11/1/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
10/31/13	.2	Receipt and review of email and attachment.
10/31/13	.2	Receipt and review of email.
10/30/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
10/29/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
10/24/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
10/17/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
10/11/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
10/10/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
10/7/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
10/16/13	4.0	Preparation for and attendance at meeting with Attorney Messana.
10/5/13	.2	Receipt and review of email and attachments.
10/5/13	.2	Receipt and review of email and attachments.
10/4/13	.1	Receipt and review of email and attachments.
10/3/13	.1	Receipt and review of email and attachments.
10/1/13	.1	Receipt and review of email and several attachments including
		notice of hearing and motion to strike.
10/1/13	.3	Receipt and review of email and attachments.
9/30/13	.3	Receipt and review of email and attachments.
9/27/13	.3	Receipt and review of email and attachments.
9/27/13	.2	Receipt and review of email and attachments.
9/23/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
9/17/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.

EXHIBIT "A" TO
AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF DEFENDANTS STEVEN JACOB AND GUARDIAN ANGEL TRUST, LLC'S
MOTION FOR ATTORNEY'S FEES

	1 2	
9/17/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
9/16/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
9/10/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
9/5/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
8/28/13	.4	Receipt and review of email and attachments; Review of amended interpleader action.
8/19/13	.1	Receipt and review of email.
8/29/13	2.5	Meeting with client.
9/16/13	.5	Phone conference with client.
9/17/13	1.5	Preparation for and attendance at hearing on motion to dismiss.
10/3/13	.3	Phone conference with client.
10/28/13	.5	Phone conference with Attorney Messana.
11/1/13	1.7	Preparation for and attendance at status conference.
12/2/13	.3	Phone conference with Attorney Dan Matlow.
12/19/13	.5	Phone conference with Attorney Messana.
8/20/13	.2	Phone conference with Attorney Messana.
10/18/13	.1	Email to and from Attorney Messana.
10/10/13	.1	Email to and from Attorney Messana.
10/11/13	.1	Email from Attorney Messana.
10/11/13	1.1	Email to Attorney Messana.
10/16/13	.5	Several phone conferences with Attorney Messana and client resettlement.
10/29/13	.5	Several phone conferences with Attorney Messana re settlement.
10/31/13	.7	Phone conference with Attorney Messana re settlement; Receipt and
		review of email from Attorney Messana.
11/6/13	.8	Phone conference with Attorney Messana re resolution of Guardian
		Angel, SPJ and Jacob issues.
11/12/13	1.3	Phone conference with Attorney Messana re settlement.
TOTAL	26.0	